
 

 
 
DATE:            BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
June 12, 2014              Condiments, Spices & Staples, RFP #142103 
           
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
A fifteen (15) month pricing agreement to provide condiments, spices and staples for school 
cafeterias as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse.  Ninety-one (91) items bid, with 
seventy-four (74) items awarded.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet cafeteria usage 
requirements.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.  Items awarded as a lot 
are awarded to the vendor with the aggregate low total price for that lot.  
 
Effective Dates:  June 25, 2104 through September 30, 2015. 
 
 

 
REQUESTED BY: 
 
      Food Services 

   
            
SUPPLIER NAME:                   ITEMS AWARDED:      ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 
 

Asian Food Solutions, Oviedo, FL              1    $         1,550.00 
Butler Foods of Pensacola, Cantonment, FL     8      45,130.00 
Butter Buds, Racine, WI         3      19,680.00 
Chef Paul Prudhomme’s, Harahan, LA      3      46,520.00 
Filled Bagel Industries, Avon, IN       1      22,320.00 
J&J Snack Foods, Pennsauken, NJ         4      86,500.00 
JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH          2      25,160.00 
Kelley Foods of Alabama, Elba, AL       4      13,630.00 
MJM Marketing, Kailua Kona, HI       2    136,080.00 
Red Gold, Elwood, NH         6      89,120.00 
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL      14    105,970.00 
US Foods, Montgomery, AL      26    177,920.00   

  
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:      FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$769,580.00 Est. / 15 mos.          Food Services Fund (4110)  

 
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid              Responses Received:   19         Bids Rejected:  1  

 
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 
      June 12, 2014, 4:00 pm Central Time 
 
 
9500 PUR100 (11/10) Retention – 5 Years 

 
 

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 
PURCHASING & BUSINESS SERVICES DEPARTMENT 

 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE: June 2, 2014
BID NBR: 142103
BID TITLE:  Condiments, Spices & Staples

Where two prices are shown, the bottom price is the bid case/pack size
Top price is unit price needed to determine low cost because of vender differences in case count

ITEM Jalapeno Pickles, 
Sliced Rings Peppers cn Sliced Dill

Quantity: 90 cn 300 gl 150 cs 100 cs
0502170 0502180 0502190 0502211

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid 8.7433 6.0950
Cantonment, FL 7.4800 52.4600 24.3800
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA
Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV
Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID
JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama 7.6500 No Bid 7.3660 No Bid
Elba, AL 45.9000 44.2000
Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI
National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT
Sysco Gulf Coast 5.6600 8.7750 4.4583 6.2000
Geneva, AL 34.0000 35.1000 26.7500 24.8000
US Foods No Bid 7.6350 a,u 8.2625 a,u No Bid
Montgomery, AL 30.5400 33.0500
Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN
J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, New Jersey

Black Olives, Banana Pepper 

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted
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ITEM Pickle Relish Pickle Relish
Whole Sweet gl Dill gl Spears

Quantity: 150 cs 50 cs 30 cs 150 cs
0502230 0502240 0502250 0502260

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola 8.5725 9.1100 No Bid
Cantonment, FL 23.6900 34.2900 36.4400

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid 6.9750 6.9875 No Bid
Geneva, AL 27.9500 27.9500

US Foods No Bid 8.2025 a,u 6.5750 a,u No Bid
Montgomery, AL 32.8100 26.3600

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Not Awarded

Kosher Dill Pickles Kosher Dill Pickles,
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ITEM Salsa, Marinara Alfredo

Canned cn Imitation Sauce cn Sauce Mix lb
Quantity: 200 cs 30 gl 400 cs 200 cs

0502393 0505110 0505200 0505230
ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola 5.4517 5.4217 No Bid
Cantonment, FL 32.7100 20.9900 32.5300

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.6000
Racine, WI 44.8000

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.5000 a,y
Las Vegas, NV 97.2000

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 5.0910 No Bid
Elba, AL 16.9700 30.5500

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.0272 m
Oak Park, MI 46.6500

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC 4.2267 m No Bid 4.0600 No Bid
Elwood, IN 25.3600 24.3600

Rodelle, Inc No Bid a,u No Bid 3.3522
Fort Collins, CO 3.34 47.2000

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast 10.0250 No Bid 4.8250 5.7625
Geneva, AL 40.1000 28.9500 46.1000

US Foods 10.1400 4.9915 5.8825
Montgomery, AL 40.5600 10.8800 29.4900 47.0600

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Vanilla Extract,
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ITEM Croutons, Shortening, Oil, Mayonnaise,
Individual ea Solid Cottonseed Light gl

Quantity: 50 cs 50 cs 50 cs 100 cs
0505240 0507032 0507011 0507040

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.0770 No Bid No Bid 11.5100
Cantonment, FL 19.2400 46.0400

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.07016 No Bid No Bid 5.5750
Elba, AL 17.5400 22.3000

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.0790 1.1990 8.3250 5.3875
Geneva, AL 19.7500 59.9500 49.9500 21.5500

US Foods 0.0676 a,u No Bid No Bid 5.3075
Montgomery, AL 16.9000 21.2300

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
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ITEM Mayonnaise, Mustard, Mustard, Barbeque
Red.Fat, Ind. ea Prepared gl Individual ea Sauce gl

Quantity: 2,400 cs 100 cs 1,800 cs 1,200 cs
0507330 0507060 0507070 0507080

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.0901 2.8750 0.0147 a,Y 5.8000
Cantonment, FL 18.0200 11.5000 2.9400 23.2000

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.0600 3.1370 0.2665 a,u No Bid
Elba, AL 12.1300 12.5500 5.3300

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.1060 4.8125 No Bid 9.8000
Geneva, AL 21.2000 19.2500 39.2000

US Foods 0.0525 4.7250 0.0147 a,u 7.3250
Montgomery, AL 10.8500 18.9000 2.9500 29.3000

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Condiments, Spices Staples 142103 Page 5



ITEM Ketchup, Vinegar,

Tomato cn Individual ea White Sauce
Quantity: 450 cs 2,500 cs 100 gl 100 gl

0507090 0507102 0507110 0507120
ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola 3.8633 0.0181 2.1525
Cantonment, FL 23.1800 18.1100 1.9800 8.6100

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 0.0147 4.2500
Elba, AL 14.7800 1.8370 17.0000

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC 3.3300 0.0120 No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN 19.0800 11.7000

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid a,u
Fort Collins, CO 22.8400

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast 3.4166 0.0161 2.3750 4.7000
Geneva, AL 20.5000 16.0500 18.8000

US Foods 3.1630 0.0128 2.2500 m 4.7500 m
Montgomery, AL 18.9800 12.7500 2.2500 19.0000

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Ketchup, Tomato Worcestershire
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ITEM

Low Fat, Ind. ea Low Calorie ea
Quantity: 150 cs 100 cs 100 cs 300 cs

0507150 0507230 0507160 0507190
ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.6102 No Bid 3.2250 0.0292
Cantonment, FL 35.1500 58.0500 5.8400

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc 0.24688 a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV 35.5500

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.4168 0.1057 p,u No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL 24.0100 10.5700

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc 0.2344 a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO 13.5000

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1110 p,u
Geneva, AL 11.1000

US Foods 0.3898 0.0994 p,u 2.2211 0.1055 p,u
Montgomery, AL 22.4500 9.9400 39.9800 10.5500

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Not Awarded
ITEM

Individual ea Individual ea Dressing ea Individual ea
Quantity: 800 cs 200 cs 200 cs 200 cs

0507210 0507240 0507260 0507290

Lt/Red.Fat, Ind. ea

Honey Mustard, French Dressing, Thousand Island Chinese Hot 

Salad Dressing ea
Ranch Dressing, Italian Dressing, Italian Dressing,Ranch Style, Dry
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ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0155 m
Oviedo, FL 7.7500

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.1060 0.0905 0.0945 No Bid
Cantonment, FL 21.1900 18.1000 18.8900

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.0699 0.0413 0.0600 No Bid
Elba, AL 13.9500 8.2600 12.0500

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.06325 0.03975 0.04325 No Bid
Geneva, AL 12.6500 7.9500 8.6500

US Foods 0.0607 0.0363 0.0403 No Bid
Montgomery, AL 12.1500 7.2500 8.0500

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
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ITEM BBQ Sauce Spaghetti
Individual ea Individual ea Low Sodium ea Sauce cn

Quantity: 200 cs 1,500 cs 500 cs 1,000 cs
0507300 0507320 0507350 0508050

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.0925 0.0720 0.3781 4.4117
Cantonment, FL 18.4900 14.3900 31.7600 26.4700

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.0589 0.0499 No Bid 4.5700
Elba, AL 11.7800 9.9890 27.0600

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid 0.0860 p,u 0.3100 3.7433
Elwood, IN 21.5300 26.0700 22.4600

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.05475 0.04875 No Bid 4.72500
Geneva, AL 10.9500 9.7500 28.3500

US Foods 0.0535 0.0453 No Bid 4.0000
Montgomery, AL 10.7000 9.0500 23.9800

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Tartar Sauce Salsa, Dipping Cup

Condiments, Spices Staples 142103 Page 9



ITEM Pizza
Sauce Frozen lb Salt-Free lb Salt-Free

Quantity: 500 cs 200 cs 300 cs 300 cs
0502350 0513220 0503050 0504200

ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39 40

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola 4.0783 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL 24.4700

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid 0.4764 a,Y,m No Bid
Harahan, LA 7.6200 u

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid 1.4827 m No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH 44.4800

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC 3.1850 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN 19.1100

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid 0.6500 No Bid
Geneva, AL 78.0000

US Foods No Bid No Bid 0.6915 No Bid
Montgomery, AL 82.990

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Not Awarded

Alfredo Sauce, All Purp. Seasoning Mexican Seasoning
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ITEM White Onions
Salt-Free oz Salt-Free Pepper

Quantity: 200 cs 300 cs 100 cs 150 cs
0510210 0510270 0502090 0502160

ITEM NUMBER 41 42 43 44

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's 5.1900 a,Y 0.0110 a,Y No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA 62.25 m 105.96 m

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid 0.1764 a,u a,u a,u
Fort Collins, CO 59.2800 131.1600 34.9600

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL

US Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL 78.5600

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Not Awarded Not Awarded

Garlic and Herb Lemon Pepper 
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ITEM Coloring, Coloring,
Low Sodium Low Sodium Yellow Green

Quantity: 300 tubs 300 tubs 100 pints 100 pints
0504010 0504020 0505050 0505060

ITEM NUMBER 45 46 47 48

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL

US Foods No Bid
Montgomery, AL 7.8166 6.6650 10.1000

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Not Awarded

Meat Base, Beef, Meat Base, Chick
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ITEM Coloring, Allspice, Chili Powder, Garlic,
Red Ground Dark Granulated

Quantity: 100 pints 150 cn 100 cn 200 cn
0505070 0510010 0510220 0510340

ITEM NUMBER 49 50 51 52

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid 0.0060 a,u 0.0070 a,u 0.0080 a,u
Fort Collins, CO 6.2600 4.7700 4.8800

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL

US Foods No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL 10.6200 7.9900

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Not Awarded Not Awarded
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ITEM Gravy Oregano, Paprika,
Base Ground Ground Ground

Quantity: 50 qt 75 cn 50 cn 375 cn
0510430 0510602 0510630 0510690

ITEM NUMBER 53 54 55 56

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL 7.7360

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid a,u a,u a,u
Fort Collins, CO 3.7000 4.2700 7.9700

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL

US Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL 6.8500

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded

Pepper, Black,
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ITEM Poultry Salt Salt,
Seasoning Individual

Quantity: 75 cs 100 cn 100 cs 50 cs
0510721 0510750 0510780 0510800

ITEM NUMBER 57 58 59 60

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid 0.0050 No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO 3.7600

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL 13.9500

US Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL 4.2500

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Not Awarded Not Awarded

Pepper, Black,
Ground, Individual
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ITEM Hot Sauce, Lemon Tea Flour,
Individual ea Juice Bags All Purpose

Quantity: 1,000 cs 300 gl 300 cs 300 bg
0507200 0503020 0503040 0505180

ITEM NUMBER 61 62 63 64

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.0487 4.6250 No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL 9.7400 18.5000

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.0034595 No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL 34.9500 19.4500

US Foods No Bid 8.5350 No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL 34.1400

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Not Awarded
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ITEM Flour,
Whole Grain Whole Grain ea Whole Grain ea

Quantity: 75 bg 500 cs 3,600 cs 600 cs
0505190 0505210 0505250 0506170

ITEM NUMBER 65 66 67 68

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid 0.1600 a,Y No Bid
Emmett, ID 48.0000 m,u

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid 0.1080 0.1080
Kailua Kona, HI 32.4000 32.4000

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid 0.18/0.20 a,Y No Bid
Westport, CT 34.56/38.40

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.6290 No Bid No Bid 0.13083
Geneva, AL 31.4500 39.2500

US Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL 23.7900

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid 0.1180 No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ 23.60

Whole Wheat
Fettucine Noodles, Graham Snacks, Giant Cinnamon 
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ITEM Fruit Oats Hominy
Snacks ea Grits

Quantity: 200 cs 50 cs 100 cs 400 cs
0505260 0506121 0506130 0508042

ITEM NUMBER 69 70 71 72

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL 17.5500

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid
Geneva, AL 29.9500 26.2500 35.0000

US Foods 0.2688 No Bid
Montgomery, AL 25.8000 32.5000 22.1500

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Spaghetti Noodles,
Thin, Whole Grain
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ITEM Rice, Vegetable Jelly, Sugar,
Brown Fried Rice lb

Quantity: 300 bg 800 cs 800 cs 150 cs
0508090 0508140 0502200 0511121

ITEM NUMBER 73 74 75 76

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid 1.9100 a,u No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID 57.3000

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI 22.0000

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast 8.1666 No Bid
Geneva, AL 27.0000 49.0000 29.9500

US Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL 17.5600

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Not Awarded

Portion Packs Confectioners
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ITEM Sugar, Sweetner, Cream of
Granulated Artificial Soup Mushroom

Quantity: 300 bg 100 cs 45 cs 45 cs
0511170 0511182 0512040 0512050

ITEM NUMBER 77 78 79 80

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL 48.5000 48.7500

US Foods No Bid
Montgomery, AL 19.4000 32.8000 32.2500

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Not Awarded

Cream of Chicken
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ITEM Whipped Breadstick,

Topping Whole Grain ea Whole Grain ea Red.Fat WG ea
Quantity: 50 cs 1,200 cs 450 cs 900 cs

0513051 0516642 0517050
ITEM NUMBER 81 82 83 84

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid 0.0926 a,u No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN 22.2300

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.1320 No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL 34.0200 19.0200

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Novi, MI

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.1277 No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL 31.7000 18.4000

US Foods 0.1283 0.6220 0.1066
Montgomery, AL 33.1000 18.4800 31.1000 20.8900

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid 0.1100 a,Y No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN 18.6000

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid 0.2300 m 0.1028
Pennsauken, NJ 27.6000 18.5000

Pretzels, Soft, Cookie Do. Frozen
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ITEM Biscuits, Roll Dough,
Themed ea Whole Grain ea Wheat ea Nut Butter

Quantity: 875 cs 2,400 cs 1,500 cs 300 cs
0517370 0517290 0517280

ITEM NUMBER 85 86 87 88

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid 0.1191 a, u No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN 25.7200

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid 0.1900 a,u No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID 41.1900

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 0.1446 0.0791 No Bid
Elba, AL 31.2400 30.4000

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid 0.1757 a,u No Bid
Novi, MI 50.6000

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fort Collins, CO

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid 0.1656 0.094975 No Bid
Geneva, AL 30.1500 38.7500

US Foods No Bid 0.1299 No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL 28.0500

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp 0.1680 No Bid 0.0592 No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ 24.2500 24.1500

Not Awarded

Cookie Dough, Sunflower Seed
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ITEM Hummus
Butter ea Garlic ea ea

Quantity: 300 cs 300 cs 300 cs
0502100 0502110 New

ITEM NUMBER 89 90 91

Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL

Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN

Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Butter Buds 2.9783 2.9783 No Bid
Racine, WI 17.8700 17.8700

Chef Paul Prudhomme's No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harahan, LA

Global Foods, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid
Las Vegas, NV

Good Source Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

JTM Provisions Co. No Bid No Bid 1.8077 N,Y
Harrison, OH 54.2300

Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL

Midas Food No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oak Park, MI

MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HI

National Food Group, Inc No Bid No Bid 0.3500 a,u
Novi, MI 42.0000

Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN

Rodelle, Inc No Bid No Bid 0.1000 a,u
Fort Collins, CO 39.000

Skeeter Snack, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
Westport, CT

Sysco Gulf Coast 3.3583 3.3583 No Bid
Geneva, AL 20.1500 20.1500

US Foods 3.3783 3.3783 No Bid
Montgomery, AL 20.2700 20.2700

Filled Bagel Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid
Avon, IN

J&J Snack Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ

Pan/Food Spray, Pan/Food Spray,
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing 
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/ 

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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